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that followed led ultimately to the period of unrest and civil war. This, in turn, 
made possible the rise of demagogues and tyrants, which led, ultimately, to the 
downfall of the Republic and the beginning of the empire. The citizenship figures 
cited by Williamson speak for themselves. In 204, the census listed 214,000 men. 
In 115, the census figure had grown to 394,336. By 70 the figure was an astonishing 
910,000. This vast increase in voting citizens, many from remote areas with little 
knowledge of Rome or Roman political mores and many whose loyalties lay with 
their military commanders, smoothed the way for men such as Sulla, Pompey, and 
Julius Caesar.
	 Not to be ignored is Williamson’s epilogue, which draws comparisons between 
the experience of Roman imperial expansion and that of British imperial expansion 
and, thereby, provides a series of fascinating leads for other scholars to follow. All 
those interested in modern imperial history should read this epilogue.
	 Williamson has written a very good book, one that every scholar of Roman law, 
Roman history, and imperial history must read.

	 M. H. Hoeflich
	 University of Kansas

Golfo Alexopoulos, Stalin’s Outcasts: Aliens, Citizens, and the Soviet State, 
1926–1936, Ithaca and London: Cornell University Press, 2003. Pp. 256. $45.00 
(ISBN 0-8014-4029-7).

Why, one might reasonably ask, would anyone living in Stalin’s USSR care about 
being denied the right to vote? Although carefully staged elections for central and 
local state bodies took place with much fanfare in the 1920s and 1930s, it seems 
counter-intuitive to think that most residents of the USSR would brave the potential 
dangers involved in protecting their right to participate. Yet, as Golfo Alexopoulos 
shows in this fascinating book about the “disenfranchised” (lishentsy in Russian, 
literally those “deprived” of voting rights) in the decade 1926–36, Soviet citizens 
did just that, in massive numbers—complaining, supplicating, or impassively pe-
titioning state officials in order to secure the right to vote and, along with it, the 
economic and social benefits that came with full membership in the Soviet pol-
ity. Alexopoulos’s book will become the standard English-language account of 
Soviet policies toward the disenfranchised, as it exhaustively covers the evolution 
of this legal and social category from its introduction shortly after the 1917 Bol-
shevik revolution to its formal abolition by the USSR Constitution of 1936. Yet 
Alexopoulos’s account goes far beyond legal and institutional history, analyzing 
the practice of disenfranchisement as it related to the formation of Soviet social 
identities, Soviet social engineering schemes, and modes of interaction between state 
and individual that characterized the Stalinist dictatorship. She shows that voting 
rights functioned as a marker for a broader boundary between citizen and alien and 
hence became the object of vigorous contestation by all involved, from top Party 
officials down to the disenfranchised themselves. Methodologically sophisticated 
and firmly grounded in a rich source base, this study—part legal history, part social 
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history, part history of the daily bureaucratic and cultural practices that shaped a 
specifically Soviet mentality—deserves attention not only from Soviet specialists 
but also from those interested in the intersections between law, culture, and social 
identity in the modern world.
	 Alexopoulos begins with the decision by the nascent Bolshevik state to deny vot-
ing rights to “bourgeois aliens” and officials of the Tsarist regime, a move that was 
originally intended to blunt the social and political strength of pre-revolutionary 
elites. Although official regulations focused on social background, local electoral 
officials immediately targeted broader categories of non-laboring or “exploitative” 
elements, equating “bourgeois values” with a wide range of behaviors viewed as 
amoral, criminal, or socially deviant. These categories expanded drastically after 
roughly 1926, with the beginning of Stalin’s “revolution from above,” as numerous 
new behaviors were deemed “anti-Soviet” and hence grounds for disenfranchise-
ment. Small-scale traders, those who lived on unearned income or hired labor, the 
poor, and dependent family members of the disenfranchised all became possible 
“outcasts,” losing voting rights and, along with them, what access they had to 
tightening supplies of consumer goods and state services.
	 Yet “Stalin’s outcasts” were hardly passive victims in this process. State officials 
may have seen the disenfranchised as social aliens, hiding their bourgeois identities 
behind masks of contrition and loyalty to Soviet power, but the disenfranchised 
themselves sought rehabilitation on the basis of often sincere personal narratives 
of suffering, ignorance, achievement, and service to the Soviet state. In making 
such claims, petitioners helped to define the Soviet polity itself, a process that took 
place on the margins of society as aliens, citizens, and local officials all sparred 
over definitions of genuine Soviet identities. In asserting their own “true” Soviet 
selves, Alexopoulos argues, petitioners reshaped the very set of values that the 
regime took as the basis of its exclusionary concept of social engineering, recast-
ing notions of social background and class status in terms of honest labor, upright 
family relations, military service, and other values that became quintessentially 
“Soviet” in the early Stalin era.
	 Despite its continued centrality to the construction of the Stalinist polity, Alexo-
poulos shows that disenfranchisement was, by the mid-1930s, largely superfluous 
to state control of populations deemed “anti-Soviet.” Even as disenfranchisement 
campaigns peaked in the last years of the 1920s, they began to be overtaken by 
other forms of exclusion: forced deportation of supposedly rich peasants as part 
of the collectivization of agriculture, transfer of surveillance functions from civil 
agencies to the secret police, and especially the creation of the notorious Soviet 
internal passport system in 1932, which limited access to major cities for a mas-
sive number of “outcasts.” Alexopoulos shows that the 1936 Constitution, which 
returned voting rights to most residents of the USSR, was not intended to eliminate 
or even reduce the more onerous social and economic restrictions that disenfran-
chisement entailed, especially those related to geographic mobility. Many of the 
disenfranchised, especially those repressed in the collectivization drives of the 
early 1930s, assumed otherwise and sought to regain both their voting rights and 
their status as insiders after 1936. They were sorely disappointed. Most remained 
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outside the Soviet body politic, subject to suspicion and to numerous forms of 
discrimination; many fell victim to the deadly campaigns against “anti-Soviet 
elements” during the Stalinist terror of 1937–38. By the late 1930s, rehabilitation 
and redemption were no longer among the most important of “Soviet values.”

	 Paul Hagenloh
	 The University of Alabama

J. H. Elliott, Empires of the Atlantic World: Britain and Spain in America, 
1492–1830, New Haven: Yale University Press, 2006. Pp. 560. $35.00 cloth 
(ISBN 0-300-11431-1); $22.00 paper (ISBN 9-780-300-11431-7).

J. H. Elliott has spent a lifetime exploring the society and politics of early modern 
Spain and Spanish America, most recently as Regius Chair of Modern History at 
Oxford. He has drawn on this deep knowledge to produce a magisterial compari-
son of the Spanish and British empires in the Americas. The book thoughtfully 
synthesizes secondary sources rather than presents new findings based on archival 
research. Since my review appears in a journal of legal history, I will concentrate 
on his treatment of government and post-revolutionary statebuilding, though at 
the cost of placing to the side Elliott’s discussion of social structure, religion, 
demography, identity, and a host of other important subjects.
	 Elliott notes that much comparative work on British and Spanish America either 
draws strong contrasts (as suggested by the title of James Lang’s Conquest and 
Commerce: Spain and England in the Americas [1975]), or finds underappreci-
ated commonalities (as when Jorge Cañizares-Esguerra emphasized the shared 
chivalric, crusading spirit of both empires in Puritan Conquistadors: Iberianizing 
the Atlantic, 1550–1700 [2006]). Elliott appears equally interested in similarities 
and differences. He does not devote chapters wholly to one empire or the other; 
nor does he proceed chronologically. Instead, he organizes his chapters by prob-
lems or developments common to both empires (say, “occupying American space” 
or “confronting American people”). This format allows him to present material 
from both the British and Spanish experiences sequentially within the chapter or 
intermixed, almost braided, in ways that highlight similarities and differences in 
how the two empires met shared challenges. While Elliott devotes attention to 
indigenous peoples and Africans, he mainly emphasizes settler societies.
	 His treatment of government in the British and Spanish empires does not present 
a novel interpretation so much as lay out themes developed over the last two genera-
tions of scholarship (to which Elliott himself contributed much). The Spanish crown 
imposed administrative, judicial, and ecclesiastical bureaucracies on its territories 
in order to reap the immense riches of the Americas and oversee the Christianiza-
tion of millions of Native-Americans. The crown did not permit representative 
assemblies, and elected town councils over time hardened into self-perpetuating 
oligarchies. The bureaucracies provided a site for negotiation and compromise 
among the metropolis, American officeholders, and settler interest groups, thereby 
allowing for the limited resistance and reciprocal relationship that vassals expected 
in their dealings with the crown. In English America, political and administrative 
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