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appears to be destroyed by the Old Age Pensions, which will
probably be found to militate, not only against economy in
wages, but also against the permanence of service, which is of
so great value in asylum administration.

The Lunacy Commission.

The hope of an increase in the personnel of the Commis
sioners in Lunacy is still deferred. With a Chancellor of the
Exchequer wanting twenty to twenty-five millions of additional
revenue such petty affairs as the addition of two or three
thousand to expenditure will not receive much attention.

The writer of our review on the Commissioners' Blue Book

suggests that the over-full treasuries of some of the registered
hospitals might serve the purpose of a suitable hen-roost for
this end, but even this is not probable, since it would require
special legislation.

In the meantime the overwork of the existing Commission
continues ; the serious needs of the insane remain unsatisfied
and are continually increasing.

The Lunacy Commission has suffered serious losses by
death in the past few years ; although this may not be directly
ascribable to overwork it is certain that the large amount of
sickness amongst its members has caused great stress to the
survivors, and is calculated to reduce their ability to cope with
their annually increasing work.

Prospects of Lunacy Legislation.

The possibility of lunacy legislation in the coming year is
probably very much greater than for many years past. The
great Bills which absorbed all the time of the House of
Commons are defunct, and there is little encouragement in the
present state of parties to introduce controversial measures ; as
a consequence the road is open for bills of a non-political
character.

A Lunacy Bill is reported to be in preparation, and if
introduced early in the Session will have a good hope of
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