
much of the conceptual vocabulary developed in the
previous book—although, unfortunately, not all of it is
adequately explained to the reader.
Despite the book’s many merits, it bears noting a few

weaknesses. The book’s richness and sophistication often
manifest in a dense and freighted reading experience.
Quotations from primary and secondary sources abound,
including some extensive block quotes from the scholarly
literature, many of which may strike the reader as unneces-
sary and cumbersome. More substantively, despite pur-
porting to address popular sovereignty “in a more creative
way than democratic theory does today” (p. 9), there is
minimal engagement with either contemporary demo-
cratic theory or recent scholarship on the history of
popular sovereignty. This is surprising given the recent
torrent of research on “the people,” popular sovereignty,
and populism. Indeed, readers acquainted with this litera-
ture may find the claim that the people possess “two
bodies” unsurprising, if not familiar. This is not merely
because, as the author briefly notes in a footnote, the
phrase was previously used by Edmund Morgan, Sheldon
Wolin, and Eric Santner, but also because a number of
prominent political theorists have already described the
people to be two-sided—from Bonnie Honig’s claim that
the people is always and also a multitude (Emergency
Politics: Paradox, Law, Democracy, 2009), to Jason Frank’s
conception of the “double inscription” of the people as
both constituted and constituent power (Constituent
Moments: Enacting the People in Postrevolutionary America,
2010), to Richard Tuck’s historical reconstruction of the
orienting distinction between (popular) sovereignty and
government (The Sleeping Sovereign: The Invention of
Modern Democracy, 2016). The reader is left wondering
how Fumurescu’s framework of the people’s two bodies
builds on, departs from, or modifies the various positions
staked out in this well-grooved literature. Indeed, through-
out the book each of the people’s two bodies is affiliated
with a motley constellation of ideas (on the one hand:
democracy, liberal contractarianism, majoritarianism,
individualism, and populism; on the other: republicanism,
covenantalism, hierarchy, federalism, and technocracy)
whose relationship to one another goes unexplained,
making the paradigm difficult to situate within the land-
scape of contemporary theory.
Democratic theorists are likely to find unsatisfying the

book’s uncritical attitude toward the question of the
people’s boundaries. In what sense can the Puritans—
who preceded the formation of the American state bymore
than a century—be said to have contributed to making the
American people? If we concede the Puritans’ place, then
why not indigenous Americans or enslaved Africans or
even settlers in colonial Virginia? Fumurescu suggests “for
the making of the American people… these groups… have
provided less important contributions, insofar as the idea
of a people implies a certain set of contrived beliefs” (p. 1;

emphasis in original). Although the author establishes the
influence of the Puritans’ ideas, the framing nonetheless
seems to presuppose the givenness of the very people in
question—a presumption that recent democratic theory
has deeply problematized. Moreover, the issue of bound-
aries raises the question of race, which is sidelined in the
book (despite some scant discussion of slavery in chapter
6) but which has often sharply marked the limits of
American peoplehood. Indeed, the racialized exclusions
foundational to the American polity may be understood as
the frequent cost of compromise. Which raises the ques-
tion, Is this a cost we can afford? The answer, of course,
depends on who “we” are, which is fortuitously a question
for which Fumurescu’s book provides important food for
thought.

The Politics of Repressed Guilt: The Tragedy of Aus-
trian Silence. By Claudia Leeb. Edinburgh: Edinburgh University Press,
2018. 256p. $125.00 cloth, $29.95 paper.
doi:10.1017/S153759272000064X

— David Lebow , Harvard University
david_lebow@fas.harvard.edu

Claudia Leeb offers a psychoanalytical study of Austrian
involvement in Nazi atrocities and recent efforts to avoid
confronting this past. The basic claim of the book is that
repression of the feeling of guilt undermines the capacity
of individuals and collectives to exercise critical judgment,
thereby enabling moral failure, violence, and even mass
murder.
Leeb’s theoretical intervention is the concept of

“embodied reflective judgment.” Drawing from Kant’s
aesthetic theory, Hannah Arendt suggests that the political
faculty par excellence is reflective judgment, in which
thinking proceeds from particulars without mediation by
pregiven determinate concepts. Leeb argues that Arendt is
too one-sidedly cognitive, that thinking and feeling are
entangled, and that critical judgment requires embodied
emotion. As a sort of corrective to Arendt’s denigration of
“cheap sentimentality,” Leeb turns to Theodor Adorno’s
negative dialectics. Inhering in the “remainder” that
escapes “identity thinking” is a material element to mor-
ality, located in the physical feeling that something is
wrong. Leeb contends that the separation of thought
and feeling is “perfected” by totalitarianism—a massive
breakdown in feeling as well as thinking.
Leeb focuses almost exclusively on guilt as a precondi-

tion for embodied reflective judgment. Psychological
defense mechanisms to avoid confronting unconscious
guilt about injustice cripple judgment. Stock phrases,
dehumanizing “scientific” language, overidentifications
with the collective, false projections, “balance accounts
of guilt,” impersonations of the aggressor, displacements
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of anger, and careerism all pave the way for distorted
judgment and potential violence.
Leeb’s introduction documents Austrian complicity

with National Socialism and subsequent nonconfronta-
tion with that past. Chapter 1 criticizes Arendt and unfolds
the idea of embodied reflective judgment. The next two
chapters are studies of trials of individual perpetrators and
the guilt repression behind their failures of judgment.
Chapter 2 examines Dr. Franz Niedermoser, who mur-
dered patients at an Austrian psychiatric hospital during
the Nazi regime. Although he was initially reluctant to
carry out murders he felt were wrong, mechanisms of
moral disengagement soon dissolved his capacity to feel
guilt and to engage in reflective judgment, allowing him to
kill without anxiety. Chapter 3 draws from the work of
Giorgio Agamben to describe the figuration of Roma and
Sinti as homo sacer, abandoned by law but subjected to the
political and thereby exposed to death with impunity. At
Dachau, Roma and Sinti were forced to undergo scientific
experiments known to be lethal. When the man who ran
the experiments, Professor Wilhelm Beiglböck, was later
tried, his defense exhibited startling continuity with Nazi-
era thinking in attempting to exonerate him by dehuman-
izing his victims as “gypsies” and “asocial.”
The last two substantive chapters turn from the criminal

guilt of perpetrators to the intergenerational political guilt
of the Austrian community. Chapter 4 centers on the
1988 staging of Thomas Bernhard’s play Heldenplatz in
Vienna and the furious condemnation it elicited even
before opening. Leeb documents the defense mechanisms
at play as vitriol bubbled up to fend off confrontation with
unconscious guilt. Chapter 5 picks up an evenmore recent
controversy over the proposed Haus der Geschichte his-
tory museum in Vienna. Innumerable objections, each
more captious and absurd than the last, were summoned
to resist a centrally located museum that would candidly
foreground Austrian collaboration with National Social-
ism. Once again, Leeb comprehensively documents each
psychological defense mechanism. The conclusion
emphasizes the similarities in guilt repression between past
individual perpetrators and collectivities avoiding that
past.
Leeb should be commended for asserting the relevance

of psychoanalysis to political theory. Liberal rationalism
and postmodern depictions of a subject produced by
discourse and power have together crowded out political
theory sensitive to the repressed unconscious. Arendt’s
ideas about judgment, particularity, and exemplary valid-
ity have been one basis for the endeavor to cut a sort of
middle course that breaks with political theory explicitly
grounded in Kant’s universalistic political philosophy of
right without forsaking normativity altogether. By chal-
lenging Arendt for being insufficiently attuned to feelings
and their unconscious management, the book stakes out
its own compelling, alternate Freudian mezzo position. I

myself cannot begin to fathom our moment of hostile
ethnic nationalism and authoritarian populism without
recourse to psychoanalysis and Adorno. For instance, one
mechanism described by Leeb that might be ripped from
the headlines is “DARVO”: Deny claims that prompt
feelings of guilt, Attack those making the claims, and
Reverse the roles of Victim and Offender.

Leeb also convincingly demonstrates psychological con-
tinuities between perpetration and retrospective denial.
One particularly stark example involves an Austrian aca-
demic denigrating any Austrian museum that would evoke
feelings of guilt by juxtaposing Austria with the United
States. In the United States, home to its own famous
Holocaust Museum, one “works with emotionalism and
offers fast identifications” because Americans are forced to
deal with a “very heterogeneous audience in terms of
ethnic background and educational background.” By con-
trast, the more homogeneous Austrians “should
strengthen the idea of scientific rationality” (p. 196).
The symmetries are only too clear: ethnic diversity remains
the problem, and the rationalized bureaucratic mass pro-
duction of death should not be memorialized with emo-
tion.

This exhaustive cataloging of the array of psychological
fortifications erected by Austrians can feel question-beg-
ging in the chapters on memorialization. Any viewpoint
other than an unblinking stare into the abyss of the past is
classified as repression of unconscious guilt; alternative
possibilities are never considered. Although Leeb contrasts
salubriously “tackling” feelings of guilt with neurotically
“suppressing” them, the book never articulates how a
politics where the past no longer weighs like a nightmare
on the living might appear (p. 2). Communities must
strive to “take responsibility for crimes,” “resolve” their
guilt, and “repair” the past, but what it might mean to
overcome the past without denying it is never specified.

Leeb tenders a connection between repressed guilt for
“unrepaired” past violence and the “potential of present-
day violence”; embodied reflective judgment is imperative
“to avoid the disasters that plagued the past from being
continued in the present and the future” (pp. 223–24).
Leeb quotes Adorno himself, who wrote, “The past will
have been worked through only when the causes of what
happened then have been eliminated” (p. 55). Though
breakdowns in embodied reflective judgment were a
necessary condition of mass murder, they were not the
root cause. If we follow Adorno’s collaborator Max Hor-
kheimer—”whoever is not willing to talk about capitalism
should also keep quiet about fascism”—then we might
think that the potential for “new cycles of aggression and
hatred” is generated foremost not by enduring repression of
guilt, but by enduring social forms like capitalism (Max
Horkheimer, “The Jews and Europe,” in Critical Theory
and Society: A Reader, eds. Stephen Eric Bronner and
Douglas MacKay Kellner, 1989). The book does make
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the trenchant point that the division of labor facilitates the
division of bureaucratized thought from privatized feeling.
But this is as far as Leeb goes in linking the psychological to
the sociological.
I worry that efforts to reground normativity on Ador-

no’s “new categorical imperative”—Auschwitz, never
again—drift toward the very identity thinking that the
book is assiduously avoiding: subsumption of a particular
under the universal that “brutally” identifies the object
with a stereotype (p. 141). The risk is that the Holocaust
becomes the singular crime, both incomparable and that
against which everything is compared. What is this if not
stereotyped rule-based thinking inhibiting us from sensi-
tivity to new particulars? Might “never again” itself be a
defense mechanism to reconcile our consciences with
cataclysms that do not fit this pre-formed category (the
depredations of neoliberal freedom and environmental
doom come to mind)? Or take another, more immediate
example of exceptionalism-cum-defense mechanism: the
US Holocaust Memorial Museum in Washington, DC,
recently asserted the total incommensurability of the
Holocaust and condemned applying the term “concentra-
tion camp” to US mass detention of migrants.
My hunch is that the book relies so heavily on the

exemplary summum malum of Nazi mass murder because
this retrieves a crypto-foundationalism compensating for
the moral uncertainty that follows Arendt’s “unfreezing
concepts” and “thinking without a bannister.” But the
anxiety that comes with living as what Leeb calls a
“subject-in-outline”—breaking with total identification
with the collective without completely abandoning it—
must not be repressed by retreating into surreptitious
identity thinking, even unconsciously. Nor can we permit
such retreat to let us evade our own collective guilt and
responsibility for today’s world on the brink.

Liberalism, Diversity andDomination: Kant, Mill and the
Government of Difference. By Inder S. Marwah. Cambridge:
Cambridge University Press, 2019. 306p. $99.99 cloth.
doi:10.1017/S153759272000095X

— Keally McBride, University of San Francisco
kdmcbride@usfca.edu

Inder Marwah’s new book challenges political theorists
who have been involved in uncovering colonial processes
and logics, as well as delving into the difficulties of
achieving decolonization. In today’s scholarly climate,
liberal political theorists and critics of liberalism frequently
talk past one another, so in some respects it is quite a
pleasant shock that Inder Marwah’s Liberalism, Diversity
and Domination works so hard to speak across this par-
ticular divide. Marwah wants both groups to reconsider
the relation of liberal thought and diversity. He does not

ignore or excuse the many problems that scholars such as
Uday Mehta, Jennifer Pitts, Jeanne Morefield, Sankar
Muthu, and many others have uncovered in the liberal
political tradition. Indeed, if there is a way of capturing the
spirit of Marwah’s argument, it might be the word “none-
theless.”
There are two audiences that Marwah is writing for in

this careful, articulate volume. The first is liberals who
have moved away from John Stuart Mill and have
realigned themselves under Immanuel Kant’s star; the
second is critics of liberalism for its shortcomings sur-
rounding gender and race. Marwah wants to convince
both camps to reconsider the value of Mill. He admits,
“Mill is no longer the wellspring of moral, political,
normative or institutional insight to which liberals turn
in navigating ethical and political dilemmas” (p. 3). Con-
versely, “since 1971, Kant’s stature in liberal political
theory has become virtually hegemonic” (p. 3). In
response to this shift, Marwah’s second and third chapters
engage in an extensive consideration of Kant’s theory in
relation to human diversity: they uncover a stadial theory
of development within it, thereby challenging neo-Kant-
ians. In effect, Marwah shows that women must subor-
dinate their own interests to provide the spur to male self-
improvement. The more asymmetrical gender relations
are, Kant argues, the more the male capacity for morality is
developed. “‘The female sex,’ as Kant most succinctly
captures it, ‘is for the cultivation of the male sex’” (quoted
on p. 89). How about that as a statement of means/ends
rationality? In making this move, Marwah shows that,
contrary to many contemporary interpretations, domin-
ation is an essential element in Kant’s scheme for the
perfection of moral capacity; therefore, Marwah wants
liberal political theorists to question their newfound alle-
giance to him.
Next, he wants them to rediscover the neglected tools

that rest within Mill’s thought. The fourth and fifth
chapters are dedicated to his resuscitation. Marwah admits
that Mill did initially share in his father’s more schematic
and overtly racist understanding of the relationship
between British and Indian citizens. However, Mill’s
mental breakdown led him to reject his father’s frame-
works. The younger Mill discovered that, contra his
educational upbringing at the hands of his father and
Jeremy Bentham, human beings were more than mere
bundles of rational thought and that relationships, culture,
and feelings also needed to be taken into account. J. S.Mill
nursed himself back to mental health through a steady diet
of British romantic poetry, and Marwah explains that the
rest of his life’s work can be understood as pursuing a
grand synthesis between romanticism and empiricism.
It is in chapter 3, “Democratic Character and the

Affective Grounds of Politics,” that Marwah makes his
strongest arguments for Mill. Marwah argues that race
plays no significant role in Mill’s later work, particularly in
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