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In 1762, a ghost ship appeared off the Tunisian coast between Tabarka and Bizerte during
the spring equinox, notorious for treacherous weather. According to a local chronicler:
“Perceived in the distance was a ship with masts but no flag flying that approached the
shore, then drew away. It was the month of April [1762] and unusually cold . . . the next
morning, we saw the vessel veer toward land while a violent tempest raged.”1 Wrecked
on the rocky shoreline, it funneled unimaginable wealth to pastoralists, villagers, and
scavengers from far and wide. The ship proved to be without passengers or crew whose
fate remains unknown until this day.

My essay opens with this story fragment to urge historians to tease out unimagined
ports-of-entry and social portals for viewing land and sea relationships, whether their
work focuses upon the Mediterranean or larger bodies of water. A prime concern in this
contribution is how “objects”—naval stores, weapons, machinery, textiles, and novel
comestibles—traveled, were recycled, or were resold.2 The essay’s premise is that small
unexplored spaces on the Mediterranean Sea’s North African rim bid us to contem-
plate how the Mediterranean was navigated and experienced elsewhere. The proposed
methodology interlaces historical ethnography, different kinds of biography, and envi-
ronmental history. Things slide momentarily out of focus, while others unexpectedly
surface, as was argued in my book Mediterraneans.3

Before the second-wave surge of research on Ottoman maritime history, the Sea’s
northern shores had long been privileged by historians. In the present rush to the water,
the Basin’s eastern end still attracts more notice than points west of Alexandria.4 Until
recently, the Maghrib was peopled mainly by shady Moors, renegades, captives, and
pirates, and after 1830, by “the colonized,” although the historiography is shifting.
Nevertheless, a handful of port cities cum capitals—Algiers and Tunis—occupy center
stage, while smaller ports—Tetouan, Annaba, and Tabarka—languish in obscurity. We
know something about North African vessels docking in Marseille or Livorno, or seized
on the high seas, but little of ships foundering or smashed to bits at anchor during storms.
Literature on shipwrecks during Antiquity and on seafaring for the British Isles, navy,
and empire is substantial.5 As metaphor and genre, ships in distress have inspired an
enormous corpus of literary and artistic works. Yet virtually nothing exists for the North
African shores of the Sea, even in the modern era.6

A major problem is that the Mediterranean is approached with a cadastral mentalité.
Scholars are loath to linger on beaches or wharves; nor do they climb into lighters or board
ships. Sailing specialists—navigators, divers, and seamen—are hardly recognized, if at
all. The identities of brokers are vague; the “land and sea” interface—social vistas from
the water’s edge—remains uncharted. Coast-hugging “provinces” tend to be severed
from a vague “interior,” home to land-lubber peasants and pastoralists. Mediation is
cast as a human activity monopolized by “minorities.” I would argue that “natural” or

https://doi.org/10.1017/S0020743816000878 Published online by Cambridge University Press

mailto:juliac@email.arizona.edu
http://dx.doi.org/10.1017/S0020743816000878
http://crossmark.crossref.org/dialog/?doi=10.1017/S0020743816000878&domain=pdf
https://doi.org/10.1017/S0020743816000878


Roundtable 751

geographical entities such as islets, whether inhabited or not, functioned as mediators.
Complex, highly variable climatic conditions dictated who sailed where, when, and how;
as such, they constituted social actors of a sort as well.7 And an unexamined assumption
begs for reflection: the notion that “to be connected” was deemed desirable or positive
for contemporaries. In brief, cultural and/or political evidence, factors, and explanations
do not suffice.

Let’s revisit the saga of a ghost ship adrift with neither crew nor passengers. Eventually
winds hurled the ship onto shore where pastoralists from the Mogod tribe grazed flocks
in springtime. As the vessel shattered, people scurried to the bluffs to watch. For the
locals, the tragedy proved a wondrous blessing. After the huge swells subsided, “all the
commodities of India and Christian countries washed ashore . . . the riches of the East
and West.” Foragers hastened from everywhere. Men and women combed the beaches
where they collected “grey amber, musk, and precious stones, and European textiles
. . . the price for textiles dropped . . . because markets, homes, and even the tents of the
pastoralists were filled with them.”8 Rural peoples seemed unaware of the value of the
Indian white cotton, velour, and satin thrown up on the sand. But folks in the capital
knew better. Putting aside disdain for provincial bumpkins, the bourgeoisie of Tunis
invaded the Mogods’ territory as did eager shoppers from across Ifriqiya. “And the poor
became rich.”9

Some goods drifting through global marketplaces as flotsam and jetsam deposited by
tides were entirely new. Washed ashore was coffee, already widely consumed in North
Africa. Yet containers of white iron sheltered unknown products: “small round leaves
resembling the leaves of capers.” Traders in Bizerte identified the mystery plant as
tea. This snippet of information suggests that denizens of Tunisian ports consumed tea,
perhaps as an elite beverage that was unfamiliar to peasant households.10 Subsequently,
pastoralists harvested the vessel’s masts for firewood, picking them clean until nothing
remained. For years after, the currents disgorged more treasures. This spit of coastline
must have attracted water gleaners from all over for a long time. The national identity of
the ship was never ascertained, generating lengthy local and international diplomatic and
legal wrangling. Thus emerges one complex channel for the circulation of things from
near and far away—as they were lost, found, sold, and purchased—a Mediterranean and
oceanic economy of debris and scavenging.

Small slivers of data from the water’s edge have in fact offered a panoramic view to
historians of the Mediterranean. First, there is the matter of who knows how to swim.
The Mogods’ shaykh dispatched divers to the wreck to reconnoiter. Bizerte boasted
skilled divers because for centuries it served as a hub for the lucrative coral industry; yet
that “pastoralists” braved the waves seems intriguing. Moreover, the tribesmen operated
a well-oiled system for profiting from calamity. Guards were posted on the bluffs and,
after the doomed vessel broke open, trains of pack animals carried away some spoils.
Did the Mogods know that the spring equinox was a fortuitous season to reap “all of the
riches of India and the West”?

Ships and their contents were seized, bartered, resold, repurposed, and ransomed in
the same way that people were. Their hulls and masts were prized in wood-hungry
North Africa. Many cherished objects circulated widely in gray or black markets as
“contraband,” violating state regulations and/or international treaty obligations. Wrecks
offered an abundance of rare and precious goods, mundane objects such as iron ore, and
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things never before seen.11 Paradoxically, shipwrecks forged connections on multiple
registers and scales. Cargoes circulated in the wake of disaster and ownership was
contested in a mare’s nest of legal arenas posing the jurisdictional issues of Islamic law
versus the bilateral treaties concluded between the Husaynid Dynasty and European
powers. Did 18th-century Tunisian rulers and courtiers, who adjudicated many maritime
contests, apply Maliki and/or Hanafi prescriptions for losses, jettison, collision, salvage,
and title? Did Islamic legal norms inform actual on-the-ground practices and how did
long-established bilateral commercial treaties with European powers come into play?12

My essay sought to engage in travel and coresidence simultaneously. Anthropologie
partagée was combined with histoire croissée to flush out approaches for “land and sea,”
setting conventional narratives adrift, if only momentarily. This beckons us to critically
re-evaluate the historical carrying capacity of narratives that claim to be “Mediterranean”
but fail to reach the water’s edge. Ships and wrecks as historical “containers” raise
additional questions: what mechanisms or forces channeled things as well as people
to intended destinations—or to accidental ports of call? Who were the on-the-ground
brokers between North Africa and the wider maritime world and what capillary strands
of association and trust (or mistrust) did they draw upon or violate? How did the
Mediterranean as both geocultural frame and nautical actor—with its seasons, winds,
currents, and countless islands big and small, inhabited and uninhabited—dictate who
went where, when, and how? And how does a shoreline perspective where swimmers
and Bedouins scrambled, either to save themselves from raging seas or partake of bounty
floating in the waters, contribute to “reimagining the Mediterranean”? Remapping the
Mediterranean as contact zones of varying scales and tempos, rather than as a single
unified sea, paradoxically resutures it with broader historical processes or patterns.
Historians need to decamp from the Mediterranean’s well-studied shores to peer into
different centers as well as margins.
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