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The history of European integration is usually presented as both a peace project and
an economic endeavour. What is largely ignored is that it also had a colonial
dimension. This article first recalls this largely forgotten history, asking why and how
it could be erased from memory. It then explores ways in which the EU and its
predecessors constituted a new postcolonial identity and how colonial legacies
somehow reappear in policies and representations.

Europe’s colonial past is not merely an epoch of overseas power that is now decisively
over. It is the beginning of an irreversible global transformation that remains an
intrinsic part of ‘European experience,’ and is part of the reason that Europe has
become what it is today. It is not possible for Europe to be represented without
evoking this history and the way in which its active power has continually constructed
its own exclusive boundary – and transgressed it.1

The traditional view on the history of European integration as the result of some sort
of post-war enlightenment has been abandoned for quite some time now. The most
recent shift in interpretation is the recognition of the EU’s imperial and colonial
antecedents. Fear of losing Europe’s dominating position in the world has been a
powerful motive to plead for a European federation of some sort since around 1900.
This fear was not only motivated by the competition from the USA, but also by the
possibility of a ‘reawakening’ of the great Asian empires. After the Second World
War these fears materialized, and now the loss functioned as a motive to unite.2

In a real ‘Milwardian’ reversal of the perspective, Peo Hansen and Stefan Jonsson
demonstrated that post-war projects for European unity also aimed at ‘rescuing’
European colonial empires and that, in particular, the European Economic Com-
munity (EEC) had a colonial agenda.3 Their powerful argumentation refutes the view
that European integration developed as an alternative to European imperialism and
colonialism, as sometimes has been argued.4 Complementing the perspective of
Hansen and Jonsson, as well as myself in earlier publications, in this article I will
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concentrate on the colonial legacies in the European project, including the question of
how the colonial dimension could so easily have been forgotten. This amnesia,
however, raises multiple issues with regard to Europe’s self-representation and
postcolonial identity, and ultimately also for the EU as an international actor today.
In the 1960s and 1970s, the European Community (EC) (until 1967, European
Communities), the predecessor of the European Union (EU, established in 1992),
shook off its colonial legacy and reinvented a new identity based on universal values
deeply rooted in European history. From this transition the EU emerged as a ‘nor-
mative power’ defending these universal values at the international scene. But Eur-
ope’s colonial history is like a palimpsest in which the ‘after-image’ of empire
nevertheless shines through, which can effectively be seen in some EU practices up
to today.

The EC, a Colonial Empire?

The remaining European colonial empires after the Second World War were all but
ready to acknowledge the new postcolonial realities. In fact, the opposite turned out
to be true, for the main powers concerned were taken by a renewed colonial fervour.5

After the loss of Asia, they looked for ways to maintain their colonial possessions in
Africa, although they (some more than others) were aware of the mounting pressures
against colonialism throughout the world, not the least in the US and the UN.6 The
UK developed the British Commonwealth, officially constituted in 1949, as a means
to associate former colonies to the metropole, but not all countries joined. Although
Britain initially tried to firmly retain these under its control, the Commonwealth
turned into an association of free states with a common link to Britain. Its objectives,
at least in British eyes, moved from maintaining imperial dominance over enhancing
British international status and prestige to preventing communist influence. Devel-
oping economic relations and cherishing a nostalgic image of ‘Britishness’ became the
main perspective after the African countries gained independence.7 France after the
Second World War continued keeping sovereignty over its overseas territories but
created the Union Française to replace the colonial empire in 1949, giving citizenship
to all its inhabitants. Although no longer called indigènes (indigenes) and entitled to
political representation, the colonial peoples nevertheless did not enjoy the same
(political) rights as the metropolitan French – a rather extreme case of some being
more equal than others.8 Unsurprisingly, the Union Française was not particularly
successful, neither politically nor economically. Hence, France imagined an ingen-
uous construction to share the burden of its colonies by associating them in a larger
European project. With hindsight, this appears as a still-born attempt to continue
what was already lost, but this was not obvious at the time.

The eclipse of Europe’s dominance was widely lamented and ascribed to the many
divisions of the continent, devastating economic and political competition, and the
evil power of nationalism in general, which had resulted in two annihilating world
wars (in Britain, however, nationalism was rather seen as what had saved it). The
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solution, so it seemed, was European unity – somehow ignoring that it had been
European states that had conquered and ruled three quarters of the world.9

The global criticism of the country’s policy in the Dutch East Indies in the
immediate Second World War period motivated some in the Netherlands to turn for
support to other European countries to resist what they considered the ‘unfair’
treatment by the UN of ‘legitimate’Dutch colonial policy.10 They would soon though
consider a European federation as a means to continue to play a major role in
international politics, which also became a powerful motive for other countries when
they realized that their power in the new order had considerably weakened. For
France in particular, a European union offered a way to modernize its economy not
only for domestic reasons, as A.S. Milward has emphasized, but to maintain its
colonial empire.11 In fact, also in the UK, the colonial lobby upheld a similar rea-
soning: Foreign Secretary and Europhile Ernest Bevin even argued for French–
British collaboration with regard to the development of Africa, but the French were
wary of such an alliance. PM Clement Attlee preferred the Commonwealth over an
association with the weak French. But although the UK gave up its empire in South
and South-East Asia, it did not envisage the same for its Central African colonies
until after the Suez crisis, at least not in the short term.12 Belgium initially was
reluctant to engage in a European federation that included African possessions, as it
feared foreign interference in its colonial policy, but also because it could not imagine,
before 1960, that its crown jewel could ever become independent in any foreseeable
future – by keeping the Congo underdeveloped it had also prevented any strong
opposition from emerging.13

These post-war dynamics resulted in the formation of Eurafrica, an idea already
suggested by Victor Hugo in 1879 and popular in the late 1920s and 1930.14 A first
attempt to create a Eurafrican association in the Council of Europe (CoE) failed,
although the Consultative Assembly in 1952 adopted the Strasbourg Plan, which
aimed at improving economic relations with the overseas territories of European
empires. The council of ministers, however, vetoed it.15 The Organization for Eur-
opean Economic Co-operation (OEEC) also included a Eurafrican perspective,
which mainly implied that – contrary to the American objectives – Marshal funds
could be used to sustain colonial policies.16 In the European Coal and Steel Com-
munity (ECSC), the idea of an association with the overseas territories was not
retained although the possibility of a Eurafrican association was not ruled out.17 The
question, however, re-emerged in blueprints for more effective forms of European
association, such as the (failed) European Political Community (EPC) and, particu-
larly, the Common Market.

Surprisingly, the arguments for the establishment of Eurafrica in the 1950s were
virtually the same as in the 1920s and 1930s. Such an association guaranteed Europe
access to African spaces for its population, raw materials for its industries, and
markets for its finished products, in exchange for ‘development’, which mainly
referred to technical infrastructure, which would facilitate the continent’s economic
exploitation. The demographic factor, while not entirely identical to the German
demand for Lebensraum, gained a new dimension after Alfred Sauvy’s publication of
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L’Europe et sa population in 1953, in which the French demographer suggested (inter
alia) that Europe should offer ‘development’ in exchange for African ‘space’.18 The
emphasis on development corresponded to the rhetoric of the colonial civilizing
mission, but in the 1950s was formulated more in terms of modernization and argu-
ably aimed rather at placating both anti-colonial and American critics. For the US in
contrast, development encompassed technical, economic and political measures
aimed at stimulating a free world market and generating support for a liberal-
capitalist model. In this respect, development prepared for self-determination or
independence, which constituted core aspects of the American global anti-communist
struggle after the Second World War.19 The Europeans however were more ambig-
uous. The Union of European Federalists UEF for example, in its Draft of a Federal
Pact presented at the Conference of The Hague in 1948, observed that ‘the era of
national ownership of colonial territories is past. […] From now onwards a common
European policy of development for certain regions of Africa should be taken in
hand’.20 However, the French Prime Minister, Paul Reynaud, pulled no punches
stating:

We must also, if a free Europe is to be made viable, jointly exploit the riches of the
African continent, and try to find there those rawmaterials which we are getting from
the dollar area, and for which we are unable to pay.21

The dollar gap was indeed a major factor in the immediate post-war years. European
political leaders actually opposed self-determination and used the rhetoric of devel-
opment and the Cold War to maintain a colonial or, after 1960, neo-colonial rela-
tionship with the so-called ‘third world’. The US did not push its European allies
much.22

The formation of Eurafrica was especially motivated by the will of maintaining a
strong position in Africa – to keep ‘Africa for Europeans’ in the terms of the time (as
in the 1920s and 1930s) – and of constructing a European power alongside the Soviet
Bloc and the US. Especially for the French, the main advocates of Eurafrica, the
purpose was indeed not only to prevent Africa from becoming communist, but also to
keep US involvement to a minimum – certainly after the ‘betrayal’ of Suez – and to
avoid that Europe, in the terms of the German Chancellor, Konrad Adenauer,
‘would become crushed between the people of Africa and Asia if these nations should
take a hostile attitude towards Europe’.23 A few Germans, however, prioritized the
concept of development as a form of Widergutmachung after decolonization.24

Development became a key component of British, to a lesser extent than the
French and the Belgian, imperial policy. Europeans emphasized charity, technical aid
and infrastructure but far less, if at all, civic education. It is in this perspective that one
has to interpret the phrase of the Schuman Declaration that ‘with increased resources
Europe will be able to pursue the achievement of one of its essential tasks, namely, the
development of the African continent’, although how was not further made con-
crete.25 The project for the EPC foresaw the association of the European overseas
territories, but it failed. Eurafrica then became a cornerstone of the Rome negotia-
tions. France presented the association as essential from a geopolitical perspective, to
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avoid Africa succumbing to communist sirens, and beneficial for all partners – for the
colonial empires interested certainly, but also for the other European member-states
and for Africa itself. With the creation of a European development fund, its propo-
nents hoped that member-states without colonial possessions would contribute to the
project, as they too would benefit from the enlarged Euro-African market and access
to African resources, in particular raw materials such as uranium.26 Britain inciden-
tally looked at this ingenious suggestion with envy and it certainly contributed to
making the British government move towards an affiliation with the EEC – which
France particularly dreaded.27 Hence, a subtle game of attraction and competition
developed between the Commonwealth, France and the Union Française, and the
nascent EC.28 But non-colonial states remained less enthusiastic and while faced with
the French sine qua non they agreed with an association, they did not accept anything
more than a loose association with limited financial repercussions.29

Proponents of the association were careful in their use of words and avoided any
explicit ‘colonial’ terminology. The Austrian publicist Anton Zischka showed one
way, by emphasizing the ‘technocratic’ approach as an alternative for grand ideolo-
gical projects, an approach that certainly appealed to the functionalist architects of a
European union such as Jean Monnet.30 Others presented Eurafrica as an alternative
for either national independence or empire. European Socialists in particular, sub-
jected to anticolonial critiques from within their movements, considered Eurafrica as
a federal project since the early 1950s. The French socialist leader and PM Guy
Mollet defended this alternative view in a booklet published in 1958, Bilan et per-
spectives socialistes, in which he pleaded ‘to allow dependent peoples to skip the stage
of nationalism’ (emphasis in the original). In his view, the world moved in the direc-
tion of greater unity instead of nationalism. Hence, Mollet advocated a federal
structure which would limit the sovereignty of both the French and Algerians. This
would take the wind out of the sails of anticolonial agitation – and hence save Algeria
for France.31 While this argumentation could help persuade European federalists,32 it
also appealed to African leaders who were looking for alternatives to empire but were
not necessarily thrilled by the prospect of creating a European-style national state or
just feared that independence would only lead to poverty and dependence in other
guises.33

The Treaty of Rome itself illustrates the case, as it spoke in evasive and embellishing
terms about ‘the solidarity which binds Europe and overseas countries’. Referring to
‘the principles of the Charter of the United Nations’ the text specifies that

The purpose of this association shall be to promote the economic and social devel-
opment of the countries and territories and to establish close economic relations
between them and the Community as a whole (…) [which] shall in the first place
permit the furthering of the interests and prosperity of the inhabitants of these
countries and territories in such a manner as to lead them to the economic, social and
cultural development which they expect.34

The reference to the UN actually was a way of appeasing international anti-colonial
protest. Leading politicians, including the German chancellor, Konrad Adenauer,
vehemently denied that Eurafrica expressed colonial ambitions.35 But nothing in the
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plans suggested a roadmap to self-determination or independence. As Frederik
Cooper concluded with regard to European colonial policies in the 1950s, while
‘development was part of a wider policy by which colonial regimes sought to give
modernizing elites – not just pseudo-traditionalist leaders – a stake in the changing
imperial regime’, the result was merely ‘a kind of second-order citizenship derivative
from the nationality accorded by a Dominion’ in the British case and very limited
colonial representation in the French one (and none of these in the Belgian case).36

While aiming at ‘increasing trade and to pursuing jointly their effort towards eco-
nomic and social development’ (art. 3) the EEC would indeed retain Africans as
dependent on European patronage: the aid envisaged was essentially to build a
market for European products and the exploitation of raw materials and human
resources, not a sort of ‘emancipation’ and liberation. So if according to Dutch
Foreign Minister, Joseph Luns, in his speech delivered on the occasion of the signing
of the Rome Treaty, ‘These treaties that abolish the barriers between our countries
[…], will in our firm conviction create the conditions for continued economic growth
for our old continent and allow the continuation of its greatest mission of world
civilization’, it may be clear that this ‘greatest mission of world civilization’ was not
meant to be completed soon.37 It was also an outspoken paternalistic one, as in
contrast to what had been foreseen in the Strasbourg Plan and the EPC project, there
was even no mention of the representation of Africans, in whatever capacity, in the
decision-making bodies of the EEC or the European Development Fund.38 The
rhetoric actually followed the model of the civilizing mission that had legitimized
European colonialism.39 Hence, Eurafrica was conceived as a pure-sang colonial
enterprise, not a neo-colonial (or post-colonial) one,40 even if the African territories
were only ‘associated’ and not fully included in the EEC (apart from Algeria, which,
albeit with a lot of conditions, was an integral part of France).

The project of Eurafrica confronted African leaders with difficult choices. It par-
ticularly challenged ideas about African unity, on which they were already divided.
Although the project also counted some important supporters – most notably Félix
Houphouët-Boigny of Ivory Coast – many Africans viewed the project with much
suspicion. Particularly in French Africa, many preferred the Union Française, in
which they were granted citizenship (albeit not with the same rights as metropolitan
French!). They feared that Eurafrica would constitute a regression compared with the
Union, also because Eurafrica would mean that Italians, Belgians and Germans – all
viewed worse than French – would become involved. Others, such as Sekou Touré,
Kwame Nkrumah and Frantz Fanon, privileged a Panafrican union and saw in the
Eurafrican project a means to keep Africa divided and subordinate to European
interests. Many African leaders though, such as Leopold Senghor, Habib Bourgiba
and Félix Houphouët-Boigny – all future presidents of their respective countries after
independence (Senegal, Tunisia and Ivory Coast respectively) – nevertheless even-
tually went a long way to give Eurafrica a chance, hoping to establish a relationship
of equality, even if they also expressed reservations and remained cautious. They
reckoned – or rather hoped, as especially Senghor had reservations as well – that
Europe would contribute to the development of their countries. Basically, they shared
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the western discourse on modernization: faced with a difficult and painful ‘choice’
between Africa and Europe, they – as Frantz Fanon described it41 – chose the latter;
some even ‘understood’ the European ‘need for space’ in Africa. Notwithstanding
their anticolonial stance, they had been socialized in western thinking.42

The quite explicit colonial dimension of the post-war EC quickly vanished with the
independence of most African countries in the early 1960s. Little still recalls this
period, except for some vestiges of colonial territories such as Ceuta and Melilla in
North Africa.

Colonial Amnesia or the Advantages of Forgetting

That so few associate Europe and in particular the European institutions with this
colonial past is worthy of some deeper reflection. Although at the time the connection
was obvious, Eurafrica soon disappeared from the major narratives of European
integration. The major textbooks of European integration remain entirely silent on
the issue, as do museums and exhibitions.43 The House of European History in
Brussels includes a small section on Europe’s colonial past, but disconnects it from
the following narrative on the formation of the EU. How is that possible? The answer
is not as easy as may seem at first sight.

Perhaps we should distinguish between EU institutional amnesia and that by the
different European colonial empires involved – the UK, France, Belgium and Italy in
the first place.44 Our focus in this article is on the former, although colonial memories
of European countries and of the EC/EU cannot be completely dissociated as a
(unforeseen) consequence of what Kiran Patel identified as the synecdochic character
of EC/EU discourse.45 If the EC/EU speaks for an abstract ‘Europe’, then of course
national European memories – and amnesias – are also those of the EC/EU. At first
sight the reverse is not necessarily the case.

With regard to the national colonial memories we should first observe how diverse
they actually are, even if there are also parallels and they are to a certain extent
‘entangled’.46 No doubt the British view their imperial past quite differently from the
French, while imperial ‘competition’ sometimes seems continued in the historical
representation of colonization, as between Belgian and British. The Irish and Poles
incidentally share some recollections of being colonized rather than being colonizers
themselves. But such diversities also exist with regard to other issues, which has not
prevented the EU from establishing a common historical narrative.47 This is in itself
noteworthy and illustrates how the historical representation of the EU cannot be
dissociated from national memories. However, the experience with trying to create
such a narrative out of diverse perceptions of the past after 1989 does reveal the limits
of the endeavour as well. It is also noteworthy that many historical studies on Eur-
opean memories that explicitly discuss the diversity of remembering, ignore colonial
memories, and the one that does not – Claus Leggewie’s landmark essay Der Kampf
um die europäische Erinnerung – effectively ‘nationalizes’ it.48

As regards the self-definition and representation of Europe and the European
institutions, initially the Council of Europe (CoE) had the competence and the
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instruments to develop a proper historical narrative about itself, but it is the EC that
really did so, albeit only slowly from the 1970s onwards; it, however, obtained cul-
tural competence only with the Maastricht Treaty in 1992, establishing the EU.49

However, what can be easily concluded is that in the historical self-representation,
also of the CoE, the colonial–imperial perspective is entirely missing.

Ole Wæver argued that Europe constructed a post-war identity mainly by othering
its past, which was often – although not exclusively – associated with war and
destruction, and focused on the antagonism between France and Germany.50 Colo-
nization, however, did not belong to this narrative.51 In fact, after 1945 a new nar-
rative emerged that was particularly comforting, self-congratulatory and allowed one
to focus on the future instead of the past. It emphasized freedom and human rights
(an issue to which I will return in the next paragraph). These got a particular sig-
nificance through the Cold War, which until 1989 seemed to have eclipsed other
narratives – the gradual recognition of the history of Eurafrica by historians and
social scientists since the 1990s can be viewed as a confirmation of this hypothesis,
although in my view the Cold War is overstated compared with decolonization and
the emergence of the Third World.52 The growing impact of the Third World turned
the colonial heritage into an embarrassment, all the more so as it contradicted the new
narrative, which made the need for forgetting even more compelling. The Cold War,
the emergence of the Third World as a political actor, and the self-comforting self-
image in fact all demonstrate the ‘imperative of the present’ which underpins most
historiography on European integration up to the 2000s. Many historians, especially
in the crucial 1970s, shared the same federalist beliefs and presentist mode as the
European institutions that, moreover, often supported them with funds and infra-
structures, and wrote histories of European integration that corresponded to the
ideals and narratives of the EC/EU itself.53

At this point one might suggest that this forgetting may be a natural reaction after
a traumatic experience. Decolonization may have been traumatic, which in itself
would explain processes of amnesia, suppressedmemories and an unresolved past still
in need of finding a way to settle.54 Post-war reconciliation in (western) Europe also
implied ‘forgetting and forgiving’: it took some 20 years until the most painful
memories softened and a more active healing process of remembrance could be
pursued in which the atrocities of the war became central so that the past for Europe
was not ‘allowed to become its future’ (Ole Wæver).55 This, however, implied an
active process of remembering and handling, a process well studied with regard to the
German handling of its Nazi past. Slowly, such a process has been initiated with
regard to the colonial past of national states as well, although by no means complete
and without conflicts, as the (in)famous zwarte pieten-discussion in the Netherlands
illustrates.56 However, there is no such thing with regard to the EU’s colonial history.
It, for example, would require a conscious recognition, if not of guilt then at least of
the fact that wrongdoings happened. It is hard to sustain that the EC/EU recognized
any guilt or fault at any point since the 1960s.

Another reason why colonial empires – in this respect one could include the EC/
EU – preferred to forget was of course that decolonization implied loss and defeat.57
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And if completely forgetting is not entirely possible, former colonial states usually
display a recollection of colonization that is, to put it mildly, overly benign, as if it had
been all an ‘inherently benevolent’ enterprise, ‘for the good of the people’.58 This
benevolent view actually aptly applies to the EC/EU, as is apparent in the hesitation
to call Eurafrica ‘colonial’ and the somewhat clumsy attempts to erase the colonial
past from European integration history.59 However, forgetting is not innocent. The
German historian Lucian Hölscher contends that it can be interpreted as an act of
denying solidarity – almost a damnatio memoriae.60 In this respect one may note that
by effectively dissociating itself from the colonial past, the EC/EU also escaped from
the ‘ethical imperative’ that accompanies such a recognition – and from associated
demands for excuses and reparations.61

Forgetting hence easily amounts to denial. However, Europe sometimes presents
the next step in this historical ‘reconstruction’ – in fact, a 180° reversal of the real
impact of colonization – which in France was made in the final days of the Algerian
war of liberation. It basically consists of integrating decolonization into a framework
of modernization and progress that, evidently, finds its origin in Europe: ‘decoloni-
zation now appeared as wholly consistent with a narrative of progress – the ongoing
extension of national self-determination and its corollary values: liberty, fraternity,
equality, and the Rights of Man – that began with the French revolution’, Ton
Shepard observes in his acclaimed The Invention of Decolonization (2008).62 It was a
discourse that, paradoxically, could also appeal to the colonized, as it offered a
prospect for restating themselves in a future-oriented narrative of progress and
modernization. I will return to this observation below.

In any case, the colonial amnesia allowed the EC to construct an untarnished
alternative narrative. But again such an explanation is only partially valid, as Eur-
opean states – ex-colonial empires – and the EC had to continue cooperating with
former colonies. Memories hence were, as Jan Jansen contends, ‘deterritorialized’,
something the EC could do even more easily than the metropoles.63 In this respect the
national issue was important, but in a different respect. Indeed, as the EC washed its
hands of colonial history, decolonization became entirely a national matter. The now
ex-colonial empires did not object. On the contrary: France continued to view Africa
as its symbolic territory, as came to the fore in its development policy, resulting in
recurrent tensions with the EC Directorate-General for Development (DG VIII).
That Eurafrica remained strongly connected with French colonial ambitions may
have helped in a different respect: its failure could hence easily be put on the latter’s
back. Eurafrica in contrast appeared as a technical affair of high politics and
administration. It hence shared the fate of the European institutions in general, of
being neglected and little loved, which made forgetting it all the easier.64 All this
surely facilitated the EC to dissociate from the colonial enterprise, all the more so as a
new narrative was readily available.

There are many reasons why the EC/EUmay not be too keen to remember or even
to recognize its colonial past, but in this case I wonder whether the collaboration of
the colonized/postcolonial nations was not necessary too. The colonized are as much
prime actors as the colonizers, pursuing their own agenda.65 During the time of the
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signing of the Rome Treaties and the construction of Eurafrica, anticolonial leaders
were divided. Some, among which most prominently Kwame Nkrumah of Ghana,
virulently opposed Eurafrica, launching a worldwide campaign, among other places
in the UN, to denounce the colonial policies of the EC. Others though, such as
Leopold Senghor, gave the initiative a fair chance and actually used a language of
reconciliation, which implied a way of ‘forgetting’ the colonial past. After decoloni-
zation, this line prevailed as Eurafrica blended seamlessly into the new development
action of the EC and continued in the Yaounde Convention (1963).66 Although there
remained a strong opposition, with Nkrumah again in a prime role defending the
Pan-African ideal, most African leaders rather opted for an association with the EC.
Even the African members of the British Commonwealth, which initially radically
opposed the idea, increasingly considered the association as a model to follow.67

In this context, emphasizing the colonial antecedents could be very counter-
productive for the African leaders. It surely was in their advantage to look ahead
instead of backwards. Moreover, European politicians as well as the administration
of DG VIII and the European Development Fund actively promoted their develop-
ment activities. The administration of DG VIII entertained a close relationship with
the first generation of African leaders, who found themselves strengthened by this
arrangement, as it continued to give them access to European markets – staying out
would imply losing them – and aid.68 This adds another dimension to Hansen and
Jonsson’s astute image of the EC/EU as a ‘vanishing mediator’: this collaboration
allowed diverting the memory of colonization.69 Moreover, insofar as decolonization
could be framed within the discourse of progress and modernization, it was appeal-
ing, especially for activists who, as I mentioned earlier, by their education and
schooling were moulded in the modernist mind. The European amnesia hence may
be, at least in part, African as well.

To be sure, the EC/EU was not an empire, which is a kind of state, as it empha-
tically lacked any instruments of power and expansion, in particular an army (which
does not mean that is was entirely powerless though).70 This too, in my view, may
help to explain why so many African leaders were willing to take the chance and why
this colonial heritage was so easily forgotten afterwards. There still is, however, a very
different dimension, one that I have not discussed yet: that, for the contemporaries,
Europe represented not only colonialism and oppression, but also the promise of a
better life, in all respects, and of equality and justice. This constituted a possible
keystone to construct a new identity, as we explore in the next part of this assessment.
However, that was far less evident than might appear in today’s complacent Eur-
opean self-perception.

Building a Post-colonial Identity: Difficult Transitions

If the EC is not remembered as a colonial enterprise, it is also because it embodied a
quite different narrative of peace, democracy, economic progress, development,
human rights and the rule of law, which not only appealed to themselves but to others
as well – even if they had been confronted with the opposite of these values in practice.
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Each of these values, however, raises serious questions. The view of the EC/EU as a
harbinger of democracy, for example, clashes with the nature of the European
Communities, which were created as technocratic policy bodies with the hardly hid-
den purpose of avoiding democratic control – hence the difficulty of generating
legitimation and of introducing a representative system in the 1990s.71

The message of peace was without doubt the most persuasive, although well into
the 1960s it actually mainly referred to the European lands themselves (with uncertain
and ambiguous boundaries to the east), excluding overseas territories. The 2012
Nobel Peace Prize formulated it just right when it gave its award to the EU because it
‘and its forerunners have for over six decades contributed to the advancement of
peace and reconciliation, democracy and human rights in Europe’ (emphasis
added).72 Colonial wars were obviously waged by European empires, but they were
neither perceived as ‘European’ matters nor associated with the EC, not with hind-
sight but not in contemporary sources either. The European project hence was
essentially viewed as inner-European, even if, as I argue above, it cannot be dis-
sociated from colonial-imperial goals and many plans about European unity exten-
ded far beyond the traditional geographic concept.73

Although it still took years to fully materialize, once the colonial era was left
behind, the EC/EU could fully focus on a discourse of ‘universal’ values that would
become the cornerstone of its foreign policy: with hindsight it seems a ‘liberation’ in
its own right. It actually offered a platform for the member states to shake off their
colonial pasts, trading the past in for a new and potentially very effective alternative
narrative. Europeanization hence allowed, in the astute words of David Allen, the
‘European Rescue of National Foreign Policy’.74 This was, however, not a foregone
conclusion.

Although the EC also ascribed itself a role as peace-broker, including at world
level, I will in the following focus on two other features of this self-representation: the
importance of human rights and of development.

The European Invention of Human Rights

One ‘traditional’ pillar of European identity refers to human rights and the rule of
law. In contrast to the popular image that seeks the origins of human rights in the
European humanist and Enlightened tradition, Samuel Moyn’s ground-breaking
history of human rights The Last Utopia rather argues that they ‘emerged seemingly
from nowhere and overnight’ only in the 1970s.75 That certainly is an overstatement:
Europe has a long history of referring to humanitarian principles and the rule of law
in both domestic and international politics.76 However, as Moyn convincingly
demonstrates, what was presented as human rights was closely associated with the
emerging notions of citizenship and the nation-state – as the French Declaration
stated, they were ‘rights of man and the citizen’, a significant qualification which was
only reinforced in the following century and a half. Hence, these so-called ‘universal
human rights’ in practice only benefited European interests and applied only to
Europeans: they, for example, legitimized military interventions in non-European
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countries to ‘protect’Christians and, in particular, missionaries, but never the reverse.
Nevertheless, the idea of universal rights had been formulated, albeit rather by Hai-
tian slave revolutionaries than by their French counterparts. European discourses
about equality and human dignity were at various times picked up by anticolonial
militants in Asia and Africa, who either endorsed these ideals, appealed to them in
order to confront European colonizers and challenge them to live up to these ideals –
to fight Europeans on their own terrain – or, alternatively, to reject Europe’s civili-
zation of hypocrisy altogether. In the post-war debate on human rights, anticolonial
militants played a major, although disputed, role: historians such as Samuel Moyn
and Jan Eckel argue that anti-colonial militants did not refer to the concept of uni-
versal human rights, while others such as Fabian Klose and Roland Burke explicitly
refer to the multiple uses and references to human rights.77 As regards Europe the
question is even more complex.

Human rights were seen as building blocks of the new ‘federal’ Europe as it was
imagined after the Second World War by European federalist politicians and jurists.
Although the British government opposed this association between European federal
idea(l)s and human rights,78 respect for ‘individual freedom, political liberty and the
rule of law’ (note the absence of the term ‘human rights’) became membership con-
ditions of the Brussels Treaty in 1948 as well as the Council of Europe (CoE). The
latter, in December 1950, concluded the (European) Convention for the Protection
of Human Rights and Fundamental Freedoms (ECHR). The establishment of a
European Court of Human Rights (ECtHR) was already foreseen, although it would
only materialize in 1959. From this early post-war time, human rights were for-
mulated as constituent of a new European identity, demonstrating the ambition to
break with the past. The ECHR is often represented as a ‘quasi-revolutionary idea’
as, in contrast to the Universal Declaration of Human Rights adopted by the UN in
December 1948, it implied that it was binding (at least if ratified).79 In addition,
detailed plans for a European Political Community (EPC) in 1952–1953 foresaw a
strong role of the European institutions for promoting human rights.80 All these
assessments, however, ignore the colonial dimension.

Still, the establishment of a human rights discourse was linked to colonization in at
least two ways. First, the European (western) emphasis on individual human rights
was not just connected to structural processes or a new recognition of the human
person, as both Samuel Moyn and Hans Joas postulate,81 or to defend conservative
interests –Marco Duranti’s recent thought-provoking argument82 – but also implied
a rejection of the plea for self-determination as demanded by anticolonial militants.83

Secondly, in contrast to the UDHR, the ECHR did not need to apply to the overseas
territories and, if it did, its provisions could be suspended. Free elections certainly
were not meant to apply to colonies. Although France liked to portray itself as a
champion of human rights, it rejected any infringement on its sovereignty – it cer-
tainly did not take any risk to end up in the dock – and did not sign the Convention
until 1974.84 The UK, the other main colonial empire, did so in 1952 and even
extended it, ‘generously’ in its own understanding, to the overseas territories (albeit
with exceptions), but it did not accept the clause on individual petition.
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Nevertheless, European colonialism was viewed as an ‘embarrassment’, in the under-
stating term of Fabian Klose.85 In the CoE, most European and indeed African prota-
gonists (in particular as representatives of the French overseas territories, part of theUnion
Française) were all too aware of the contradiction, and the opportunity for communist
propaganda.86 The latter argument showed how the issue undermined the Cold War
dichotomy between a ‘free world’where human rights were supposed to be upheld and the
communist sphere where they were suppressed. So, if the ambition to promote human
rights was abandoned, it was not so much because Europe opted for a more functionalist
approach, but rather because the mounting colonial tensions since the mid-1950s pre-
vented European powers from emphasizing human rights, let alone to defend themselves
against accusations of perpetrating abuses in their colonies.87 That is themain reason why
the Rome Treaties carefully avoided any reference to human rights.

However, the acceptance in the 1960s (especially after Algeria’s independence in
1964) that the days of empire and colonization were gone, changed everything. It
opened the way for the acceptance of the competence of the ECtHR – France signed
the Convention in 1974, although it only accepted the right of individual petition in
1981. TheDétente also opened space for a more critical approach in Europe. Even the
European Court of Justice (ECJ), in blatant contrast to the 1950s and early 1960s,
promoted human rights as it pursued an active policy of furthering European inte-
gration, using human rights as a major instrument to extend its authority in the
emerging institutional framework.88 Albeit with some distance, the ECtHR could
manifest itself as an important actor as well.89 Gradually, human rights emerged as a
cornerstone of European identity and of its international politics. This came to the
fore in 1962 when Franco’s Spain applied for EC membership, and with the Greek
colonel putsch, which provoked the withdrawal of Greece from the CoE in 1969. In
the early 1970s the EC especially targeted relations with countries such as Portugal,
Chile and South Africa – significant choices, as they allowed it to distance itself even
more from its colonial past. Lorenzo Ferrari concludes that they aimed at presenting
the EC ‘as a supporter of the independence of the African peoples and of racial
equality’.90 Politically, human rights dominated during the Conferences on Security
and Co-operation in Europe (CSCE) in Helsinki in 1973 and 1975, signalling the
breakthrough of human rights in European and international politics.91

The Metamorphosis of Development

A similar story can be told with regard to development. As argued above, recognizing
development as part of a postcolonial European identity was less evident than may
appear at first sight: development for European colonial powers had not meant a road
towards self-determination let alone independence, which would have required poli-
tical formation alongside furthering economic, technical and social infrastructures.
Still, it could be presented in an altruistic fashion, and perhaps more importantly as a
‘generous’ offer towards ‘less-advantaged countries’, which could put them on the way
to economic success and prosperity, in their own interpretation on a par with Europe.
That could make it sound attractive for Asians and, in particular, for Africans.
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Hence Eurafrica, although designed as a colonial enterprise, could easily be trans-
formed into something different. Illustrative is the discourse used at the signing of the
Yaounde Convention in 1963. While the convention actually confirmed the basic
agreements of the Rome Treaty with respect to the association of the overseas terri-
tories, it was presented as a ‘new start’ for Eurafrican relations on the basis of a
‘complete equality and friendly relationships’, implying full recognition of sovereignty.
A clear commitment to ‘turn the page’ was shared by all; the term Eurafrica was
explicitly banned. Development would become the new ‘mission for Europe’. Ironically
though, development was phrased in roughly the same terms as in the 1950s and
positioned Europeans again as the masters and teachers, confirming Africans in a
subordinate position, with few instruments to impact upon the decision-making pro-
cess. Moreover, aid went mainly to infrastructure, not to industrial development or
political formation, mirroring colonial practices and ensuring the continuation of
industrial inequality.92 African and, though less obvious, Asian countries after inde-
pendence continued to be perceived as ‘useful providers of labour and raw materials,
potential outlets for surplus manufactures, junior partners to be preserved from the
spread of international communism’, asGiulianoGaravini recently summarized (albeit
this was a sign of continuity rather than a new orientation as Garavini suggests).93

Moreover, the focus on development allowed dissociating development from human
rights issues, which had several advantages: it further distanced the EC from its colonial
past and allowed it to present its relations with Africa as between equals and reciprocal.
Some Europeans remained ambiguous though: the Christian democrat Mario Pedini
for example spoke of a ‘natural relationship’ between Europe andAfrica, and implicitly
referred to colonialism as ‘a particular form of international organization where certain
people – by their own authority – interpreted and organized the general well-being
(welfare) also for other peoples’.94 The denial of its colonial history implied that the EC
reinforced the unequal relationship, refusing the deliverance of remembering. But, as
we have seen, reactions in the former colonies were mixed – in some ways the idea that
Yaoundé constituted a break with the colonial past prevailed.95

In the emerging new realities of 1960s’ Europe advanced development as a source
of identity and pride, through which Europe presented itself as an ‘equal’ partner with
the Third World. Against critiques that it focused on just French and Belgian former
colonies, aid was extended to other countries as well. All African countries, also those
of the British Commonwealth, could join the Association, as was already granted in
1963.96 The Arusha agreement of 1968 with Tanzania, Uganda and Kenya – coun-
tries that belonged to the British Commonwealth – illustrated the desire to break with
a past of competing imperial legacies. Development policies moreover were flanked
by increasingly important trade policies: ‘trade not aid’ became the key concept in the
1960s and 1970s – although the principle of reciprocity that the EC demanded
benefited the European member states considerably more than it did the Africans.
But in the 1970s, culminating in the Lomé Convention of 1975, this was gradually
changed to the benefit of the African countries.97

The change in policy was slow though. Many civil servants responsible for the EC
development policies, among whom Commissioner Robert Lemaignen and his Head
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of Cabinet EDF director Jacques Ferrandi, had earned their spurs in the French and
Belgian colonial administrations before. Their policies continued to focus on eco-
nomic and technological cooperation, taking in account the ‘realities’ ‘on the ground’
and collaborating with the local leaders, as had been the case before 1960. In her
pioneering study on the European development infrastructure Véronique Dimier
hence labelled DG VIIII ‘the last French colony’, although she also recognizes
the tensions between especially French and European perspectives.98 Essential in the
discourse of DG VIII was the concept of ‘altruism’: the EEC ‘generously’ gave where
others – the UN – gave loans. But of course this only illustrates the profoundly
paternalistic attitude that still prevailed.99 Nevertheless, the EC administration took
matters in its own hand and systematically raised the bar; it certainly played a key
role in making development an important ingredient of EC policy. Very soon after
the implementation of the EDF, tensions arose between the administration and
national governments, which culminated in the Lomé Convention of 1975. Although
often viewed as a revolutionary break in the relationship with the former colonies, as
it included a firm commitment to an equal partnership and non-reciprocity with
regard to the opening of markets to the advantage of the African, Caribbean and
Pacific (ACP) countries that signed the convention, the actual trade relationships
remained unequal and, in sum, largely to the advantage of the Europeans.100 More-
over, the decisions mainly reflected intergovernmental bargaining between the EC
member states, in particular France and the United Kingdom. They had developed
quite different relationships with their former colonies and in practice largely
‘defended’ the interests of their former ‘empires’, acting effectively as ‘patrons’ to
their former colonies.101 This being said, one should not underestimate the impact of
African leaders especially on European – at least French – national policies either.102

Building a New Identity

By the early 1970s the European Communities found themselves once again – and
obviously not for the last time – facing an existential crisis. Although the enlargement
of 1973, when the UK, Ireland and Denmark joined the EC, showed the latter’s
growing symbolic power, it certainly also demanded institutional and cultural
adjustments proper to any merger operation, especially as some of the new members
from the very beginning had different ideas about the nature of their alliance.
Moreover, the European economy was slowing down, putting an end to the so-called
‘golden sixties’. The first Oil Crisis of 1973 would effectively plunge Europe into a
lasting economic depression. But the changed geopolitical context also caused con-
cern. The US adopted a more unilateral course, while a certain détente between the
superpowers opened up space for more autonomous European policies.103 Decolo-
nization often seems underrated although it transformed the world profoundly, as the
crisis in the Middle East demonstrated. Although the transition towards the new
postcolonial realities happened surprisingly smoothly, at least after the main colonial
battles were lost – the Congo in 1960 and Algeria in 1962 – the EC still had to
reposition itself. It took more than a decade before the EC formulated a new vision
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about itself in the new world. The impetus to do so came both from within the
European institutional realm – including the legal activism of both the ECJ and the
ECtHR – and from outside, such as NGOs.

At an international conference of EC heads of states in 1972, combating under-
development was for the first time formulated as a foreign policy objective, which was
further confirmed by the Copenhagen Declaration on European Identity in Decem-
ber 1973. It also stated as its ambition ‘to safeguard the principles of representative
democracy, of the rule of law, of social justice and of respect for human rights’,
explicitly aligning itself with the international community through the UN, which
became a key element of EC international policy – a very significant evolution that
merits a separate assessment.104 Nevertheless, the document displays a remarkable
ambiguity entirely in line with the discourse in use since the Rome Treaties: it refers to
the ‘close ties’ that European countries had developed ‘with many other parts of the
world’. Passing over a long tradition of imperial and colonial violence, it presents the
EC as ‘an assurance of progress and international equilibrium’ (art. 5). The text
euphemistically speaks of ‘long-standing links’ in the case of ‘the Mediterranean and
African countries’. The declaration mainly emphasizes the EC commitment to play
an active international role – actually the text speaks of ‘its proper role in the world’
(emphasis added) – and ambition to develop an intense relationship with its former
colonies, although any reference to the colonial and imperial nature of those rela-
tionships is carefully avoided. Although the international ambition is stated in terms
of promoting justice, equality, prosperity and security, colonial hierarchy reappears
in the unequal presentation of different regions and in the outspoken moral under-
tone, recalling the colonial ‘civilizing mission’. The text is also interesting in that it
emphasizes the unity of the communities on a ‘civilizational’ basis, again referring to
an essentially colonial concept, very similar to the way human rights were promoted
as a cornerstone of the new Europa after the Second World War, effectively under-
lining its superior position.105

The 1975 Tindemans Report on the future of the European Communities, named
after its author, the Belgian Prime Minister Leo Tindemans, constituted another
important moment in the search for a new identity and positioning of the EC in a
postcolonial world order. It was based on the extensive consultation of politicians,
institutions, pressure groups, academics and think tanks supposedly representing
some sort of European public opinion. It focused on common identity politics and
promoting social cohesion.106 Tindemans, however, realized that the relationship
between the EC and what was now called the ‘third world’ constituted a major issue,
which required reaffirming Europe’s role in global politics.107 Although the Belgian
PM downplayed the significance of colonial history (sharing the extremely com-
placent Belgian attitude towards its colonial past) and emphasized the need for a
strong EC common policy as a global power, some of his interlocutors warned
against ‘imperialist’ motives.108 The Netherlands criticized EC policies as neo-
colonial, targeting in particular the Lomé convention, and referred to a ‘historical
responsibility’ of Europe towards the Third World – unaware it seems of the
ambiguity of the idea, which however was widely shared at the time.109 The French
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socialist François Mitterrand, seemingly the only one who called a spade a spade
and spoke about ‘the world that had previously been colonized by force’, considered
EC policies explicitly neo-colonial, but he remained vague as regards an alter-
native.110 The French government, and the final text of the Tindemans report,
rather believed in the economic ‘take-off’ of the Third World as a result of their
control of raw materials, which was seen as an opportunity as well as a threat, both
for the West and for many Third World countries – the report emphasized the
former, but implicitly, as the discussions show, the latter was perceived as more
acute.111 But ‘luckily’, as the President of the European Commission, François-
Xavier Ortoli, declared in a speech at the European Parliament in February 1975,
the EC was more apt to develop relationships with Africa ‘because the European
Communities in contrast to some member states were less contaminated by a colo-
nial past’ (emphasis added).112

By shaking off its colonial heritage, which implied its ‘forgetting’ and denial, the
EC could redefine itself as an international actor promoting peace, development and
human rights, albeit that these were not linked to one another before the late 1970s.113

The resistance to associating development and human rights, however, did not come
from Europe, but rather from the African leaders. It is only in the 1980s and 1990s, in
part because of severe human rights abuses by inter alia the Ugandan dictator Idi
Amin, and the Rwandan genocide, that the perspective decisively shifted. Less
focused on a strong corporate identity, the EC/EU needed to accommodate different
sensibilities, hence it put greater emphasis on values and emphasized the idea of
‘Unity in Diversity’.114 The single European Act of 1986 claimed to:

promote democracy on the basis of the fundamental rights recognized in the con-
stitutions and laws of the Member States in the Convention for the Protection of
Human Rights and Fundamental Freedoms and the European Social Charter,
notably freedom, equality and social justice.115

The EU, established in 1993, continued this orientation and would really promote
human rights as a key element in its international policy.116

Evaluating the extent to which the EU has succeeded goes far beyond the purpose
of this article. As Karen Smith puts it, such an affirmation requires more than lofty
words or even humanitarian policies:

Analysing the extent to which the European Union promotes human rights and
democracy, and with which instruments, and how consistently, and how effectively, is
not enough. We should look at the whole of the EU’s impact on international rela-
tions and other states (whether deliberate or not), as well as what the EU is not doing,
to promote justice, understood more widely than is usually the case – though we must
debate what ‘justice’ should mean.117

Doing so goes well beyond this paper’s ambition, but – to some extent – raising the
question is already answering it. In the framework of this paper it suffices that the
focus on Europe’s civilizational discourse and amnesia with regard to its colonial past
offers another take on this issue.
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The Coutounou Agreement of 1999 illustrates the difficulties and indeed the
ambiguities of EU policies nicely: while proposing a broad package of reforms link-
ing respect for human rights, economic reforms and the efficiency of aid, it clearly
reveals the EU as a ‘normative power’ which sets the terms and manifests itself as a
prime actor in international politics.118 Emily Jones and Clara Weinhardt even sug-
gest a return of colonial practices happened since then with regard to the ‘Global
South’, for example in reintroducing ‘reciprocity’ in trade relations similar to the
French colonial policy of the 1950s: reciprocity in the case of unequal economic
relations is quite detrimental for the weaker part. In addition, EU policies remain
strikingly paternalistic.119

Epilogue

The EU quickly established itself as a peaceful and open society in which the rule of
law reigns and human rights are respected. This inspired the EU not only to base its
newfound identity and self-confidence on these principles, but to make them the
cornerstone of its emerging external policies. Robert Kagan hence commented that
‘the transmission of the European miracle to the rest of the world became Europe’s
new mission civilisatrice […] Europeans have found a new mission born of their own
discovery of perpetual peace’.120 François Duchêne, a high-level collaborator of Jean
Monnet – also his biographer – and scholar of European integration, presented the
(then) EC as a ‘new stage of political civilization’ because it acted not as an empire,
but as a ‘civilian power’.121

Political scientists have pursued this idea mainly in the wake of Ian Manners’
‘normative power’ theory.122 Manners, at least in his earlier publications,123 argues
that the EU constitutes a break with ‘pre-existing political forms and that this par-
ticular difference predisposes it to act in a normative way’, constituting a ‘normative
difference’ which apparently sets it apart from both its own imperial (?) past and the
rest of the world.124 Hence, when the then President of the European Commission,
José Manuel Barroso, called the EU ‘the first non-imperial empire’ (10 July 2007),125

which provoked a storm of protest in the (mainly British) press, he was actually in
complete agreement with mainstream political science. His words actually echo
Jürgen Habermas who wrote that Europe got a ‘second chance’ to make an
‘appearance on the world stage’, although ‘not on the terms of its old-style power
politics but on the changed premises of a non-imperial process of reaching under-
standing with, and learning from, other cultures’.126 In this respect, Richard Rose-
crance observed ‘that it is perhaps a paradox to note that the continent which once
ruled the world through the physical impositions of imperialism is now coming to set
world standards in normative terms’.127 The comment – besides grossly overstating
the EU’s impact on international politics – at least suggests the possibility of con-
tinuity: it is paradoxical only if one accepts the normative stance that the EU con-
stitutes a radical departure from imperial policies. But the very fact that it adopts such
a normative policy suggests that it is perhaps not that ‘non-imperial’ after all.
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I have already referred to normative power with regard to development. However,
the ‘normative power’ approach has in particular been used to assess the EU’s
accession policy. Critical studies argue that the EU’s accession policy displays the
same structural characteristics of the old colonial ‘civilizing mission’, albeit perhaps
without its inherent violence and legitimizing features (‘soft imperialism’, in the terms
of Björn Hettne and Fredrik Söderbaum).128 Especially in these normative dimen-
sions, the concepts of civilian and normative power (and similar) rest upon a con-
ception of superiority.129 Underlying the normative stance, as the quotation of
François Duchêne illustrates so well, is a renewed emphasis on civilization, that
quintessential imperialist concept, which once again introduces symbolic oppositions
and hierarchies, even if the latter was sometimes explicitly denied along with any
colonial association. Yet a closer look this very negation illustrates the continuing
mind-set, which I cannot illustrate better than with the following speech by José-
Manuel Barroso a few years after his earlier statement on Europe as a ‘non-imperial
empire’, but while still President of the European Commission, at the opening of the
exhibition ‘Europe meets the World’ at the National Museum of Demark in
Copenhagen in January 2012:

The exhibition also reminds us that Europe is not just about the markets […], but
Europe is about culture, Europe is about values, Europe is also about civilization – [a]
civilization that has great moments, also darker moments to be honest, but Europe is
about culture. […] it comes from the ideas of the Enlightenment, one of the greatest
moments of the European history and civilizations. We should not be afraid of the
word ‘civilization’.

This exhibition reminds us of how over centuries Europeans have helped shape the
interconnected world in which we now live. In times of peace the European continent
has been the forerunner in promoting ties of openness, trade, and exchange around
the globe […].130

The very negation of Europe’s imperial and colonial past and its replacement by a
shockingly ahistorical image of the continent as an open and benevolent civilization,
popular not just with European commissioners but also with political thinkers such
as Ian Manners, Ulrich Beck, Gerard Delanty and Jürgen Habermas, actually con-
firms its enduring impact. What, as British sociologist Gurminder K. Bhambra
observed, makes the ‘cosmopolitan’ and ‘reflexive’ argument so repulsive is the
contradiction between the claim for reflection and openness on the one hand, and
the denial (or at least understatement) of Europe’s colonial past and all it entails on
the other.131

The reflective attitude that these authors refer to is not entirely fiction though: it
refers to the self-critical, apologizing stance that Europe has taken towards its
‘domestic’ history – a self-criticism that non-European students sometimes find sur-
prising and quite puzzling and which effectively underpinned the turn towards human
rights – what Helle Porsdam has described as a form of ‘Vergangenheitsbewältigung
through law’.132 However, in an original and insightful assessment of European so-
called ‘speculative speeches’ by leading European politicians, Bernhard Forchtner
and Christoffer Kølvraa demonstrated how this ‘self-critical narration of a “bitter
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past” is, paradoxically, transformed into a self-righteous attitude towards Europe’s
“others”’.133 Ironically, the emphasis on development and human rights thus
underpins a neo-imperialist ‘civilizing mission’ attitude: as Europe managed to
overcome its ‘bitter past’, it views itself uniquely situated to ‘teach’ or lecture others,
as comes to the fore in the following statement by Barroso’s predecessor as President
of the European Commission, Romano Prodi:

[…] Partly because of the strength it derives from our civilisation, Europe can and
must be a credible partner and mediator in these new worlds, which have finally
returned to history. Over the centuries, we have contended with many new realities
that appeared from beyond our seas, and we have consistently forged new relation-
ships with peoples and countries who differed from ourselves. The tradition that we
have inherited has dominated history for this reason – this ability of ours to lead and to
set an example to other peoples and races. (Emphasis added.)134

This of course it can only do by ignoring Europe’s colonial past – hence human rights
became, in the words of Hans Magnus Enzensberger, ‘the last refuge of
Eurocentrism’.135

It is difficult to escape the ethical dimension of this forgetting. Forgetting is not
innocent. In the case of colonialism it is also about not recognizing the immense
contribution of the colonies to the wealth and prosperity of Europe, an issue that I did
not develop in this article but that should not be overlooked in a broader context.136

The issue is also related to that of guilt. Do present generations bear any responsi-
bility for the crimes of their forefathers? The issue is often raised with regard to the
European/German relationship with the Holocaust, which some like to see as ‘Ger-
many’s’ sole ‘responsibility’, but which, whether we like it or not, also applies
somehow to Europeans with regard to the colonial past. In an interesting discussion,
moral philosopher Kwame Anthony Appiah recently argued against recognizing
guilt.137 However, there are two caveats. Appiah observed that when we share and
feel connected, we may feel shame – or pride if the connection is with something
positive. There thus is a connection, if not a moral responsibility. I would add another
aspect: the moral duty not to repeat the errors of ‘our’ fathers. This ‘moral duty’may
be more compelling if we share, willingly or not, a common heritage and culture.
Forgetting and denial, I would argue, increase the risk of repeating these errors –
remembering and recognizing, even without expressing guilt or even shame, in con-
trast may constitute an effective barrier. It makes a strong case, I believe, for not
forgetting, for remembering, all the more so as the colonial heritage appears some-
how to be returning in EU practices, like damp spots in the wallpaper.

Returning to the metaphor of the EU as empire, it is perhaps more fruitful to view
the EU not as an empire, which it is emphatically not, but somehow, as historian
Stella Ghervas argues, as a conglomerate of small states and former empires that
transferred some sovereignty to supranational bodies.138 This far better explains the
ambiguities and weaknesses of both ‘domestic’ and international EU politics, as these
constitute a compromise of very different legacies, memories and ambitions. In this
respect, European history continues exhibiting imperial features without being an
empire itself. But it may still be the palimpsest of empire.
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