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Hough and Oswald have acknowledged the
major contribution of the U.S. Army’s Pro-
ject A to our understanding of personnel
selection within the field of industrial–orga-
nizational psychology. Results from valida-
tion of the Assessment of Background and
Life Experiences (ABLE) developed in Pro-
ject A provided strong evidence of the utility
of personality constructs for predicting
important aspects of military performance.
Since Project A, the U.S. Army Research
Institute for theBehavioralandSocial Sciences
(ARI) has conducted much research on the
use of personality measures for personnel
selection and classification decisions.

Our commentary will focus primarily on
the use of personality measures for high-
stakes, Army applicant screening. Much of
this research has involved either the ABLE
or the Assessment of Individual Motivation
(AIM), both self-report personality measures
assessing constructs that overlap with the Big
Five. With respect to item format and trans-
parency, ABLE is similar to many personality
measures that are widely used today. AIM
uses a forced-choice approach to help reduce
concerns regarding fakability.

Without question, the ‘‘faking problem’’
has been one of the greatest challenges to
the Army’s ability to implement and sustain
the operational, large-scale use of self-report
personality measures, especially in high-
stakes testing situations. Our focus on this
issue began during Project A when promis-
ing findings resulted in the ABLE being seri-
ously considered for use in high-stakes, Army
applicant screening. However, due primarily
to concerns about its susceptibility to faking
and coaching, ABLE was never used opera-
tionally by the Army for applicant screening.
Today—20 years later—the Army is having
some success in using personality measures
for making real-life personnel selection and
assignment decisions. In the spirit of Hough
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and Oswald’s invitation to exchange ideas,
we briefly share our key findings from these
decades of research, with the goal of suggest-
ing areas to advance future research.

Summary of Key Findings

1. High levels of faking,detectedby social
desirability scales, can lead to highly
inflated test scores that have little or
no criterion-related validity. In high-
stakes testing, where faking is likely to
be a concern, new fake-resistant mea-
sures are needed along with new
approaches to counter faking.

Initial findings from the Project A concurrent
validation sample indicated that the crite-
rion-related validity of personality constructs
remained stable even when socially desir-
able responding was elevated (Hough,
Eaton, Dunnette, Kamp, & McCloy, 1990).
However, analyses of the much larger Project
A longitudinal validation research sample
showed a very different pattern of findings,
with high levels of socially desirable
responding severely attenuating the predic-
tive validity of personality constructs across
multiple criteria (White, Hunter, & Young,
2006; White, Young, & Rumsey, 2001).

When faking was not high, uncorrected
validities ranging from .15 to .30 were
obtained for predicting job effort, leader-
ship, personal discipline (i.e., staying out of
trouble), and maintaining physical fitness.
Personality measures conceptually related
to the criterion had the highest validity. For
example, work orientation was the best pre-
dictor of job effort and non-delinquency had
the highest correlation with personal disci-
pline (White et al., 2001). However, when
faking was high, the validities of these mea-
sures were lower and typically close to zero.
In these relationships, social desirability
operated as a moderator variable, interact-
ing with the personality predictor scales,
with the magnitude of the corresponding
validity coefficient varying by degree of
socially desirable responding.

Research following Project A (White &
Kilcullen, 1998) showed similar moderator

effects in four independent militaryand civil-
ian samples. In this research, the uncorrected
criterion-related validity of personality con-
structs averaged r ¼ .28 for individuals
showing low and moderate levels of socially
desirable responding but fell to r ¼2.09 for
individuals with high levels of socially desir-
able responding.

In these and other research samples, the
percentage of cases showing elevated levels
of socially desirable responding is often low,
but in our experience, the amount of such
responding can increase substantially in
high-stakes settings, with an associated loss
of validity (Young, White, Heggestad, &
Barnes, 2004). Faking that results in inflated
test scores makes it more likely that an appli-
cant will pass any feasible selection standard
chosen for the job. Even small percentages of
high fakers are of concern when screening
high-risk applicants or selecting elite per-
sonnel where the costs of improper selection
decisions may be high.

Some investigators have argued that
socially desirable responding may be indic-
ative of social competence or measure valid
trait variance in Conscientiousness or adjust-
ment and thereby be positively related to
subsequent job performance. In our large
samples, we have found little support for
the notion that individuals who distort their
responses perform better on the job or are
more adaptable than those who do not
(White et al., 2001).

2. It is difficult to simulate the pressures
of high-stakes testing, and results of
faking experiments can underestimate
the score inflation subsequently
observed in such settings.

To help reduce concerns about ABLE’s fak-
ability and coachability, the Army devel-
oped the AIM. AIM is a forced-choice
instrument that measures the job-relevant
personality constructs from ABLE. Results
from several simulated applicant faking
experiments to evaluate AIM’s fakability
were encouraging. In these experiments,
when our standard operational warning state-
ments were used, we found only a .1 SD
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increase in AIM scores relative to research
norms, which also compared favorably
against other self-report measures of per-
sonality. Later, when AIM was subsequently
implemented for operational screening, we
observed a large rise in test scores (about 1
SD), relative to research norms (Young et al.,
2004). The resistance to faking indicated
by our simulated applicant faking experi-
ments simply did not materialize in the oper-
ational environment.

3. In the personality domain, be wary of
generalizing results across contextual
boundaries.

There are a variety of contextual boundaries
limiting the generalizability of personality
measure findings that one ignores at one’s
peril. The first boundary separates divergent
types of research designs: specifically, concur-
rent versus predictive. We first encountered
this issue in the Army’s Project A, where the
concurrent validities were not always consis-
tent indicators of the magnitude of the predic-
tive relationships. For some items and their
associated constructs, there was a close corre-
spondence between the predictive and the
concurrent validities, but for several others,
the predictive validities were nearly 50%
lower (White & Moss, 1995). This finding
clearlypointed toaneed formore longitudinal
validation research in the personality domain.

The second boundary separates research
from operational contexts. Even carefully
done large sample, predictive validation
studies may not provide a good indication
of how well the test will work after it is trans-
itioned for use in employment screening. In
the early 1980s, an empirically keyed Army
biodata instrument measuring several tem-
perament constructs, called the Military
Applicant Profile, was carefully developed
and validated on a large research sample.
When transitioned to the operational setting,
its predictive validity quickly declined to
near zero, coupled with substantial score
inflation (White et al., 2001).

Similarly, in the late 1990s, the Army eval-
uated AIM in a preimplementation research
program, in which they conducted a pre-

dictive validation with over 20,000 recruits
in addition to simulated applicant faking
experiments. When AIM was subsequently
implemented as an operational screening
measure in 2000, we observed large changes
in test scores and validity. Compared to the
research sample, those in the operational
sample scored significantly higher on AIM
and their scores were less predictive of attri-
tion (Young et al., 2004). These changeswere
not anticipated from results obtained from
our research samples, including our simu-
lated applicant faking experiments.

These boundaries are neither imperme-
able nor rigid. By understanding their nature
and their limitations, we can expand the util-
ity of our measures. We have found that
some items are valid in a concurrent design
but overestimate predictive relationships,
whereas others are valid in both concurrent
and longitudinal designs. Our results indicate
that the average concurrent validities of items
high in job content (e.g., questions about how
hard you typically work) can be inflated, sim-
ply for the reason that they ask individuals to
disclose behaviors that pertain directly to their
performance on their current job. In concur-
rent validation studies, responses to personal-
ity items high in job content seem to function
more like self-ratings of job performance and
thereby overestimate the predictive validities
(White & Moss, 1995). Accordingly, we have
found that items conceptually linked to per-
formance on the job, yet rated as low in job
content by expert panels, are more likely to
have similar validity coefficients in concurrent
and predictive contexts.

The divergence between results obtained
in a research setting from those obtained in
an operational setting is magnified when the
stakes are high and the number of partici-
pants is large. However, we have found that
it is possible to develop items that are effec-
tive even across highly distinctive settings.
We have had some success using less trans-
parent, but criterion-valid items, that show
greater resistance to deliberate faking. We
are also exploring the use of forced-choice
response formats, in combination with item-
response theory methods, to reduce fakabil-
ity (Stark, Chernyshenko, & Drasgow, 2005).
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Closing Comments

In spite of these challenges, we have had
some success in incorporating personality
measures into the Army personnel selection
and classification system. Our results in-
dicate that the use of personality measures
for employee screening can have substantial
economic utility by reducing costly turn-
over, improving job performance, or
expanding recruiting markets. Importantly,
considerable test utility is possible even
when the criterion-related validities are rel-
atively low (White et al., 2001; Young &
White, 2006). In some applications, we have
increased selection utility by combining
personality measures with cognitive ability
tests to achieve higher criterion-related
validity than is possible when either is used
separately (White et al., 2004).

Accordingly, we recommend continuing
to investigate self-report measures of person-
ality and approaches to reduce, detect, and
counter the unintended, negative effects of
faking on hiring decisions and criterion-
related validity. These include: (a) develop-
ing improved methods for detecting socially
desirable response tendencies; (b) using
warnings with consequences that faking
can be detected; (c) applying scoring adjust-
ments to eliminate any hiring bias favoring
high fakers, without lowering criterion-
related validity; (d) incorporating measures
of response distortion and their interactions
with personality constructs into equations
for predicting job success; (e) retesting when
faking is elevated; and (f) using other vali-
dated sources of information for evaluating
candidates identified as high fakers.

We are encouraged by this progress and
see several important avenues for future
research. First, we see a need to continue
to explore alternatives to our current method
of measuring personality, particularly for use
in high-stakes testing. Just as Hough and
Oswald spoke of the promise of a facet-
based approach, we see great potential in
an item-response theory–based (Stark et al.,
2005) and facet-based approach to person-
ality measurement (Roberts, Chernyshenko,
Stark, & Goldberg, 2005). Not only do we

believe this approach will result in a more
valid test, but it also enhances the opportu-
nity for development of multiple forms, com-
puter-adaptive testing, and improved control
of faking.

Second, research is needed to gain a bet-
ter understanding of the various applicant
situations and factors that moderate the gen-
eralizablity of validities from job incum-
bents to applicants. We believe that the
mind-set and motivation of test takers greatly
varies both within and between research
and applicant settings. Before we can make
substantial improvements in simulating the
actual applicant environment, a better un-
derstanding of the variability in applicant
mindsets and the situations that affect this
is crucial.

Finally, we believe that the field could be
served by hearing more from the researchers
who have worked to transition personality
tests to operational use. We have gone far
beyond the stage where the value of person-
ality testing was disparaged and believe we
are on the threshold of an era that will rec-
ognize such testing as an essential compo-
nent of the selection process.
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